
Friday 01 September 2023 08:44 - Sydney, NSWABN: 50 128 382 187

Issue Date

Tax Invoice - I.0000577683

27/11/2023

01/09/2023 Due Date

13/12/2023

01/09/2023

Consultant

Terms

CTM Travel Consultant

Zero Days

Return DateDeparture Date

MUNZER/CHRISTINA MSPassengers

PNR Reference: 6PXVH8

Debtor:

Booking Number:

Department of Agriculture Fisheries and

Booked By:

B347219

Department:

Travel Arranger:

DAFF DTC TRAVEL CARD

*Division: TRADE AND INTERNATIONAL

Branch: INTERNATIONAL STRATEGY AND
ENGAGEMENT

Travel Bookers Name:

Canberra Act 2601

Gpo Box 858

Australia

Department of Agriculture Fisheries and Forestry

Tax GSTFareDescription Due

$0.00 $0.30 $3.30$3.001 Service Fee

Fee Type: Booking Fee
Fee Description: WoAG Admin Int
Paid by CC  - 

$0.00 $0.00 $220.09$220.092 Service Fee

Fee Type: Booking Fee
Fee Description: VIP Simple Int
Paid by CC  - 

$289.00 $0.00 $1748.00$1459.003 Ticket

KOREAN AIR
Ticket Class: E - Economy
Itinerary: DUBAI- INCHEON INTERNATIONAL- SAPPORO CHITOSE

Ticket No: 9712676350
Passenger:

Paid by CC  - 1748.00 - 

01-09-2023Issue Date:

QBT Pty Ltd Trading as CTM Travel

Melbourne, VIC, 3000

Level 11, 120 Spencer Street Internet:

ABN:

www.travelctm.com.au

50 128 382 187

Email: do_not_reply@travelctm.com
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Friday 01 September 2023 08:44 - Sydney, NSWTax Invoice - I.0000577683

Tax GSTFareDescription Due

$134.78 $0.00 $8876.88$8742.104 Ticket

EMIRATES AIRLINES
Ticket Class: J - Business
Itinerary: CANBERRA- MELBOURNE- DUBAI

Ticket No: 9712676353
Passenger:

Paid by CC  - 8876.88 - 

31-08-2023Issue Date:

Airline Credit Card Fees (Inc GST): $80.10

$423.78 $10848.27

Total(ex GST) $10847.97

GST $0.30

Total Inc GST $10848.27

$0.30Invoice Total $10424.19

QBT Pty Ltd Trading as CTM Travel

Melbourne, VIC, 3000

Level 11, 120 Spencer Street Internet:

ABN:

www.travelctm.com.au

50 128 382 187

Email: do_not_reply@travelctm.com
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From:
Sent: Friday, 19 January 2024 4:02 PM
To:
Subject: RE: Request for input: Cost of COP28 - Senate Estimates Briefing [SEC=OFFICIAL]

Thank you!!  
 

From: @aff.gov.au>  
Sent: Friday, January 19, 2024 4:01 PM 
To:   @aff.gov.au> 
Cc: @aff.gov.au> 
Subject: RE: Request for input: Cost of COP28 - Senate Estimates Briefing [SEC=OFFICIAL] 
 
Hey  
 
Below are the costs for  to attend COP28. 
 

  
4 December – 12 December 

Actual 
 

Hotel $4,312.40 (includes VAT5% + non-tax able charges) 
Flights $8,849.26 
TA $1,030 
Other (taxi etc) $212 (airport parking) 
ConƟngency $0 
Total $14,403.66 

 
 

 
 

From:    
Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2024 12:26 PM 
To: @aff.gov.au> 
Cc: @aff.gov.au>; @aff.gov.au> 
Subject: FW: Request for input: Cost of COP28 - Senate Estimates Briefing [SEC=OFFICIAL] 
Importance: High 
 
Hi,  
 
Would you be able to put together costs of DAFF attendance at COP28. 
 
For me, costs were: 
 

  
28 November – 12 December (15 
days) 

Budget Actual 

Hotel 6544.05 7353.68 (includes VAT5% + non-tax able 
charges) 

Flights 10848.27 10848.27 
TA 3180 2059.33 
Other (taxi etc) 35.5 101.28 
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ConƟngency 3325 0 
Total 25,498.168 20362.56 

 
 

From: @dcceew.gov.au>  
Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2024 12:02 PM 
To: Special Representative for Australian Agriculture <specialrepresentative@aff.gov.au>;  

@aff.gov.au>; Bouhafs, Nadia <Nadia.Bouhafs@aff.gov.au>;  
    

    
  Darren Miller  

   Ian Learmonth 
   
 Helen.Grinbergs@health.gov.au;  

Stephen.BOUWHUIS@health.gov.au;   
   
 James.Hetherington@austrade.gov.au; Peter.Horn@austrade.gov.au; 

Andrew.Morgan@infrastructure.gov.au;    
   
  Justin Mohamed 

<Justin.Mohamed@dfat.gov.au>;  Cate Rogers <cate.rogers@dfat.gov.au>; 
   

   
 

Cc: Kirby, Aaron <Aaron.Kirby@dcceew.gov.au>; ;  
;  

Subject: Request for input: Cost of COP28 - Senate Estimates Briefing [SEC=OFFICIAL] 
Importance: High 
 
Good morning,  
  
Happy new year all! I hope you were able to enjoy a relaxing holiday break after a very busy year that was 2023! 놴놲놵놶놷놳  
  
In preparation for Senate Estimates this Feb, we are asking for your help to identify the Australian Governments total 
costs for attending COP28 in Dubai. To support this exercise, we’d be very grateful if you could please review the 
below table and populate the fields accordingly. We understand some costs might still be in the reconciliation phase 
and not finalised/acquitted, but would very much appreciate your support in getting final figures where you can.   
  
Grateful if I could please receive your agencies total COP28 costs by COB Tuesday 23 January 2024.  
 

Agency:  
Number of delegates:  
Airfares:  

Accommodation:  

Other costs (Meals, incidentals, 
Equipment allowance, ground 
transport, passport, visa, 
courier, travel doctor)  

 

Total  

 
Any issues please let me know! Look forward to hearing from you soon.  
 
Best Regards, 
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Business Manager 

InternaƟonal Climate and Energy Division | Climate NegoƟaƟons and Engagement Branch 
Department of Climate Change, Energy, the Environment and Water 
M  | WhatsApp:  | E   | 

 
 
DCCEEW.gov.au ABN 63 573 932 849 
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From:
Sent: Wednesday, 24 January 2024 11:12 AM
To:
Cc: ; ; 
Subject: RE: Request for input: Cost of COP28 - Senate Estimates Briefing [SEC=OFFICIAL]

Hi  
 
Sure thing - here’s just . 

  Actual  
Hotel 7353.68 (includes VAT5% + non-tax able charges) 
Flights 10848.27 
Other 2160.61 
Total 20362.56 

 
Thanks! 

 
 

From:   
Sent: Wednesday, January 24, 2024 11:09 AM 
To: @aff.gov.au> 
Cc: @aff.gov.au>; @aff.gov.au>;  

 
Subject: RE: Request for input: Cost of COP28 - Senate Estimates Briefing [SEC=OFFICIAL] 
 
Hi   
 
Apologies, are you able to please give me the individual cost breakdown of airfare, accommodation and other costs 
for   
 
Thanks,  

 
 

From: @aff.gov.au>  
Sent: Monday, January 22, 2024 4:22 PM 
To:  
Cc: @aff.gov.au>; @aff.gov.au>;  

 
Subject: FW: Request for input: Cost of COP28 - Senate Estimates Briefing [SEC=OFFICIAL] 
 

Hi  
 
Here are the numbers for DAFF. Note that 2 of our delegation live in Dubai so we didn’t need to pay for flights, 
accommodation or TA for them. 
 

Agency: DAFF 
Number of delegates: 4 in total. 

2 from Canberra and 2 from 
Dubai  
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Airfares: 19,697.26 
AccommodaƟon: 11,666.08 
Other costs (Meals, incidentals, 
Equipment allowance, ground 
transport, passport, visa, 
courier, travel doctor)  

5,478.26 

Total 36,841.6 
 
Thanks, 
 

  
InternaƟonal Strategy | Trade and InternaƟonal Division 
E @aff.gov.au  
Department of Agriculture, Fisheries and Forestry 
Ngunnawal and Ngambri Country 

 
 

From:   
Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2024 12:02 PM 
To: Special Representative for Australian Agriculture <specialrepresentative@aff.gov.au>;  

@aff.gov.au>; Bouhafs, Nadia <Nadia.Bouhafs@aff.gov.au>;  
    

    
  Darren Miller  

   Ian Learmonth 
   
 Helen.Grinbergs@health.gov.au;  

Stephen.BOUWHUIS@health.gov.au;   
   
 James.Hetherington@austrade.gov.au; Peter.Horn@austrade.gov.au; 

Andrew.Morgan@infrastructure.gov.au;    
   
  Justin Mohamed 

<Justin.Mohamed@dfat.gov.au>;  Cate Rogers <cate.rogers@dfat.gov.au>; 
   

   
 

Cc: Kirby, Aaron <Aaron.Kirby@dcceew.gov.au>;   
  

Subject: Request for input: Cost of COP28 - Senate Estimates Briefing [SEC=OFFICIAL] 
Importance: High 
 
Good morning,  
  
Happy new year all! I hope you were able to enjoy a relaxing holiday break after a very busy year that was 2023! 놴놲놵놶놷놳  
  
In preparation for Senate Estimates this Feb, we are asking for your help to identify the Australian Governments total 
costs for attending COP28 in Dubai. To support this exercise, we’d be very grateful if you could please review the 
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below table and populate the fields accordingly. We understand some costs might still be in the reconciliation phase 
and not finalised/acquitted, but would very much appreciate your support in getting final figures where you can.   
  
Grateful if I could please receive your agencies total COP28 costs by COB Tuesday 23 January 2024.  
 

Agency:  
Number of delegates:  
Airfares:  

Accommodation:  

Other costs (Meals, incidentals, 
Equipment allowance, ground 
transport, passport, visa, 
courier, travel doctor)  

 

Total  

 
Any issues please let me know! Look forward to hearing from you soon.  
 
Best Regards, 
 

 
Business Manager 

InternaƟonal Climate and Energy Division | Climate NegoƟaƟons and Engagement Branch 
Department of Climate Change, Energy, the Environment and Water 
M  | WhatsApp:  | E   | 

 
 
DCCEEW.gov.au ABN 63 573 932 849 
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Friday 01 September 2023 08:39 - Sydney, NSWABN: 50 128 382 187

Issue Date

Tax Invoice - I.0000577659

04/12/2023

01/09/2023 Due Date

11/12/2023

01/09/2023

Consultant

Terms

CTM Travel Consultant

Zero Days

Return DateDeparture Date

MCCLUSKEY/SU MSPassengers

PNR Reference: 6JWJMK

Debtor:

Booking Number:

Department of Agriculture Fisheries and

Booked By:

B344732

Department:

Travel Arranger:

DAFF DTC TRAVEL CARD

*Division: TRADE AND INTERNATIONAL

Branch: INTERNATIONAL STRATEGY AND
ENGAGEMENT

Travel Bookers Name:

Canberra Act 2601

Gpo Box 858

Australia

Department of Agriculture Fisheries and Forestry

Tax GSTFareDescription Due

$0.00 $0.30 $3.30$3.001 Service Fee

Fee Type: Booking Fee
Fee Description: WoAG Admin Int
Paid by CC  - 

$0.00 $0.00 $220.09$220.092 Service Fee

Fee Type: Booking Fee
Fee Description: VIP Simple Int
Paid by CC  - 

$269.26 $0.00 $8347.76$8078.503 Ticket

QANTAS AIRWAYS
Ticket Class: D - Business Class
Itinerary: CANBERRA- MELBOURNE- DUBAI- SYDNEY- CANBERRA

Ticket No: 9712676349
Passenger:

Paid by CC  - 8347.76 - 

01-09-2023Issue Date:

Airline Credit Card Fees (Inc GST): $83.50

$269.26 $8571.15

Total(ex GST) $8570.85

GST $0.30

Total Inc GST $8571.15

$0.30Invoice Total $8301.59

QBT Pty Ltd Trading as CTM Travel

Melbourne, VIC, 3000

Level 11, 120 Spencer Street Internet:

ABN:

www.travelctm.com.au

50 128 382 187

Email: do_not_reply@travelctm.com
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